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Men’s Bolt ACTV LS Tee

Style Number:  509773 02

Materials: 76% Polyester, 24% Lycra Sport; 
PUMA ACTV Tape; powerCELL™; Mesh 
Inserts. 

From the Bolt Collection, the PUMA ACTV* LS 
Tee takes athletic taping principles one step 
further.  

Engineered for high performance and 
endurance sports, the ACTV LS Tee is 
a fusion of compression and athletic taping 
built inside the garment.  

Previous taping methods placed tape strips 
directly onto an athlete’s skin in specific 
patterns in order to take pressure off active 
muscles.  With PUMA ACTV product, the tape 
is strategically placed to the inside of the 
shirt, helping to maximize muscle power 
during a workout. 

The stretch silicone athletic taping is 
designed to work with the body and provide 
micro-massage in specific areas of the upper 
body to help provide faster energy supply to 
the muscles. 

This powerCELL™ garment includes mesh 
inserts for enhanced breathability and 
reflective logos for visibility, adding 
functionality needed for athletic performance. 


